UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

		X	
In re:		:	Chapter 11
		:	Case No. 13-22840 (RDD)
SOUND SHORE MEDICAL (L CENTER OF	:	Cuse 140. 13 22040 (RDD)
WESTCHESTER, et al.,		:	(Jointly Administered)
-		:	
Ι	Debtors.	:	
		\mathbf{V}	

STATEMENT OF COUNSEL TO PATIENT CARE OMBUDSMAN FOR COMPENSATION FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR THE PERIOD FROM AUGUST 1, 2013 THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2013

Period for which compensation and reimbursement is being sought:

August 1, 2013 through August 31,

2013

Retention Order

August 9, 2013, effective as of June

21, 2013

Amount of Compensation

actual, reasonable, and necessary:

\$15,037.50

Amount of Expense Reimbursement

actual, reasonable, and necessary:

\$ 173.21

Total Actual Fees and Expenses

\$15,210.71

Total Due¹

\$12,203.21

(Representing 80% of Fees and 100% of Expenses)

¹ Without prejudice to seeking payment of full amount upon application



NEUBERT, PEPE & MONTEITH, P.C.

Attorneys at Law

195 Church Street, 13th Floor New Haven, CT 06510 (203) 821-2000

Federal Tax I.D. No. 06-1367531

Sound Shore Medical Center

Statement Date: Statement No.

09/16/2013 360888

Account No.

360888

Page:

1

Attn:

Daniel McMurray

Representation of Patient Care Ombudsman

Legal Services

08/01/2013	MIF	Review Montifiore affidavit	Hours 0.10
	MIF	Review debtors' response, write to client regarding same	0.20
	MIF	Review revised sale order (.1), telephone Weston regarding Custody Agreement (.1), follow up on same (.1), review new filings (.1)	0.40
	MIF	Prepare for hearing	0.50
08/02/2013	MIF	Hearing on sale motion	5.20
08/05/2013	MIF	Telephone McMurray regarding hearing last Friday and regarding treatment of malpractice claims	0.30
	MIF	Diary possible new hearing date	0.10
	MIF	Review new docket entries	0.10
	MIF	Follow up on hearing	0.10
08/06/2013	MIF	Review new docket entries	0.10
	MIF	Review signed Business Associate Agreement, compare to new version, correspond with client regarding same	0.30

Please Detach and Return This Portion With Your Remittance

Sound Shore Medical Center Client No. 3329.001 RE: Representation of Patient Care Om Statement Date: Statement No. Page No.

09/16/2013 360888 2

			Hours
	MIF	Follow up on and correspond with United States Trustee regarding status of retention application	0.30
08/07/2013	MIF	Telephone McMurray regarding signed Business Associate Agreement (.1), assemble same and write to Gulick regarding same (.2)	0.30
08/08/2013	MIF	Review new filing	0.10
	MIF	prepare and arrange service and filing of notice of presentment	0.90
	MIF	Correspond with Susan Golden regarding submission of order	0.10
08/09/2013	MIF	Correspond regarding retention order, submit copies, review order as entered	0.70
	MIF	Write to client regarding status of report	0.10
08/11/2013	MIF	Write to client regarding report	0.10
	MIF	Preliminary review of draft of report (.5), correspond with client (.1)	0.60
08/12/2013	MIF	Correspond regarding report	0.10
	MIF	Review and generate mark-up of draft report (3.0), write to client regarding same (.2)	3.20
	MIF	Correspond with client regarding posting of notice and regarding revising report (.3), telephone client regarding revising (.3)	0.60
08/13/2013	MIF	Continued review and mark-up of draft report (1.8), correspond regarding report (.4)	2.20
	MIF	Review client's July invoice and provide mark-up of same (.4)	0.40
08/14/2013	MIF	Write to client regarding revisions to invoice (.1), follow up on possible error (.1)	0.20
	MIF	Review revised draft of report and further revise	2.30
	MIF	Write to client regarding revisions and proposed further revisions to draft of report	0.30
08/15/2013	MIF	Review correspondence	0.10
	MIF	Review next draft (.4), correspond regarding same (.5)	0.90
08/16/2013	MIF	Telephone mcMurray regarding drafting of report and regarding dissemination of same (.2), write to him regarding same on weekend (.2)	0.40
	MIF	Instruct regarding table of contents (.2), follow up on format (.1)	0.30
	MIF	Review new pleading	0.10

Sound Shore Medical Center Client No. 3329.001 RE: Representation of Patient Care Om

Statement Date: Statement No. Page No. 09/16/2013 360888 3

			Hours
	MIF	Review of next draft on weekend and generate mark-up (2.5), correspond regarding same (.1)	2.60
08/19/2013	MIF	Telephone McMurray regarding process of effecting further revisions and dissemination (.2), coordinate same (.3)	0.50
	MIF	Review and correct revisions and the redlining, further revise (1.9), write to client regarding outstanding issues in report (.2), telephone client regarding same (.3), correspond with Weston (.1)	2.50
	MIF	Review correspondence and telephone client regarding comments on draft report (.1), telephone client regarding further revisions (.7)	0.80
08/20/2013	MIF	Further implement revisions and further revise draft of report (2.1), write to client and Craven regarding same (.2), final review (.4), telephone client (.1)	2.80
	MIF	Assemble invoices for filing and service, prepare cover sheet (.2)	0.30
	MIF	Arrange service and filing, assemble list, prepare letter, review order, prepare cover sheet	0.60
	MIF	Instruct regarding assembly and filing of report (.2), review order regarding same (.2), coordinate regarding service and posting (.2), and regarding Chambers copy and requestors (.1)	0.70
08/21/2013	MIF	Review new docket items	0.10
	MIF	Compile and analyze precedents for possible patient records motion, instruct regarding search and update on same (1.0), correspond regarding results (.1)	1.10
	JLC	Telephone conference with Attorney Fishman; research regarding access to behavioral health records under HIPAA and New York's Mental Hygiene Law; memo to Attorney Fishman regarding same; legal research regarding what constitutes interests of justice pursuant to New York's Mental Hygiene Law; review and update citations to motion for access to patient records	1.10
09/22/2012	NAIL.		
08/22/2013	MIF	Review precedents for patient records motion	0.10
	MIF	Diary next report and notice	0.10
08/23/2013	MIF	Review new docket items	0.10
	MIF	Write to client regarding timing and preparation process for fee application and invoice	0.20
08/26/2013	MIF	Review new filings (.1), write to client regarding same (.1)	0.20
	MIF	Correspond with client regarding narrative for his fee application	0.10
08/27/2013	MIF	Telephone McMurray regarding posting of report	0.10

Sound Shore Medical Center Client No. 3329.001 RE: Representation of Patient Care Om				Statement Date: 09/16/2013 Statement No. 360888 Page No. 4		60888	
08/28/2013	MIF	Review new docket item				Hours 0.10	
08/30/2013	MIF	Review new docket item FOR PROFESSIONAL SER'	VICES RENDERED			0.10 35.90	15,037.50
<u>Timekeepe</u> Mark I. Fish Jennifer L.	nman	arano	Recapitulation <u>Title</u> Partner Associate	<u>Hours</u> 34.80 1.10	Hourly Rate \$425.00 225.00	\$14	<u>Total</u> ,790.00 247.50
Advances							
08/02/2013 08/08/2013 08/16/2013 08/20/2013 08/20/2013 08/20/2013 08/20/2013 08/20/2013 08/20/2013	08/08/2013 Delivery services/messengers: fed ex; Honorable Robert D. Drain 08/16/2013 Court call fee 08/20/2013 Delivery services/messengers: Lisa J. Lenderman 08/20/2013 Delivery services/messengers: Afsheen A. Shah 08/20/2013 Delivery services/messengers: Fed ex; Craig E. Freeman 08/20/2013 Delivery services/messengers: Fed ex; John Spicer 08/20/2013 Delivery services/messengers: Fed ex; Susan Golden 08/20/2013 Delivery services/messengers: fed ex; Togut, Segal&Segal			I			8.00 13.17 58.00 15.02 13.17 13.17 13.17 13.17 13.17 13.17
		TOTAL CURRENT WORK					15,210.71